
National leader on fundraising 
programming selections, giving 
voice to alternative viewpoints.

We launched a new translator that 
serves Boulder, Longmont, 
Louisville & Lafayette with all 3 of 
our  digital channels.

Participated in CO-wide wildfire 
relief telethon helping to raise 
$220,000 for the American Red Cross 
& the Colorado Professional Fire 
Fighters Foundation.

Every broadcast minute costs $7. An 
incredible value as you look at the 
wide and wonderful world we bring 
to our Colorado community.

Winner of 2 Colorado Broadcasters 
Association Award of Excellence. 
Best Membership Appeal & Best 
Mini-Documentary- “Sanzen Ecstasy 
of Color.”

Teamed with the Young Filmmakers 
Workshop and the Center for Digital 
Storytelling to produce 113 hours of 
original, local content; broadcasted 
213 hours of original, local content.

CIO’s Time Machine visited 1951 
and earned another Emmy nomina-
tion- one of five in the past five 
years, of which 3 have won.

Local music is our gig. Sounds on 
29th featured twenty Colorado 
artists in season one.

Studio 12 goes international in
Uganda, Rwanda & Sudan but is 
always relevant close to home.

2012 Financial Summary.

broadcasting
public info & promotion

management & general

fundraising & membership

underwriting &grants

programming/ production

federal grants

membership

production & events

leased assets

misc. income

contributions & grants

Total Revenues: $4,768,636

Total Expenses: $4,474,957

Our 2012 Media sponsorships 
were like a bullhorn for Colorado 
Gives Day, the Peace Jam 
Foundation, & the Denver Film 
Festival.

Working with partners including 
Colorado Youth for Change, 
Environmental Learning for Kids and 
GOAL Academy + hosting 9 kids for 
a digital storytelling workshop.

The Cancer league of Colorado 
chose CPT12 as a media sponsor 
and we helped them raise $1 million 
for local cancer research.

WE          MOMS (AND DADS!)

The 2012 Media Audit names CPT12 
the #1 public media destination for 
working moms in Denver.

The CPT12 Gives Back program
spotlighted twelve non-profit 
organizations throughout Denver in 
2012, our namesake year.

gives back$gives back

Colorado Public Television 

Find out what went on last year at your favorite independent media source.
World View. Community Voice.

Education     Shared Experiences     Civil Discourse

International     State     Local

33 Years, 3 Channels

2012 Annual Report

Activists. Adventurers. Animals. Artists. Believers. Children. Creators. Dancers. Donors. Dreamers. Enthusiasts. Environmentalists. 

Explorers. Fans. Foodies. Free Spirits. Friends. Gardeners. Hikers. Historians. Hipsters. Hobbyists. Iconoclasts. Idealists. Innovators. 

Kids. Locavores. Mavericks. Musicians. Non-comformists. Originals. Parents. Realists. Rebels. Recyclers. Risk takers. Romantics. 

Seekers. Seniors. Skeptics. Teachers. Travelers. Underdogs. Visionaries. Wanderers. Welcome Here.

All things. Welcome Here.

Search the world. 

#communityinvolvement

#resource

#doinggood
#educatingkids #amgrad

#outsideourbubble

#colocaltunes
#recognizedachievement

#powerofpublictv

#creativeexcellence

#cooperativeefforts

#spreadingourreach

#moneytalk #revsareup #aidingourstate #worthwhileinvestment #independentmedia


